RFB #2024-016 FUEL & OIL BID TABULATION

VENDOR McCraw Oil Company Offen Petroleum LLC Safety-Kleen Systems
Price per Gallon 1/7/25 $1.9707 $1.8422
Regular Unleaded Gasoline (At Transportation $0.0449 $0.0000 g
__|state Tax $0.2000 $0.2000 ©
least 87 Octane Rating) S
Other Taxes $0.0066 $0.0018
Profit $0.0500 $0.2000
I Total Price Per Gallon $2.2722 $2.2440

PAGE 10F9



RFB #2024-016 FUEL & OIL BID TABULATION

VENDOR McCraw Oil Company Offen Petroleum LLC Safety-Kleen Systems
COUNTY BARN PCT 1
Price per Gallon 1/7/25 $1.9707 $1.8422
Regular Unleaded Gasoline (At Transportation $0.0449 $0.0000 g
. |state Tax $0.2000 $0.2000 ©
least 87 Octane Rating) =
Other Taxes $0.0066 $0.0018 o
Profit $0.0500 $0.2000
Total Price Per Gallon $2.2722 $2.2440
Price per Gallon 1/7/25 $2.3735 $2.1445
Diesel Fuel #2 on Highway  Meets or Transportation $0.0486 $0.0000 %
State Tax $0.2000 $0.2000 ©
exceeds ASTM spec D975 =
Other Taxes $0.0072 $0.0018 ©
Profit $0.0500 $0.2000
Total Price Per Gallon $2.6793 $2.5463
Price per Gallon 1/7/25 $2.3780 $2.1635
Off Road Diesel Fuel UltralTransportation $0.0486 $0.0000 g
Low Sulfur w/Red Dye State Tax N/A $0.0000 @
Other Taxes $0.0072 $0.0018 ©
Profit $0.0500 $0.2000
Total Price Per Gallon $2.4838 $2.3653
DRUM XD 3-30 Mobil Delvac 30 55g $895/Cam 2 HD30 55¢ $550 $8.5900|No Bid
DRUM 15W40 Mobil Delvac 15w40 55g 4725 Cam 2 15w40 55 $450 $9.1500($575.00 per drum & $48.00 per case
EXXON OIL: DRUM DEXRON Il Cam 2ATFD/M 55 g $475 $7.5600|$545 per drum & $36.96 per case
CASE/DRUM DRUM TORQUE FLUID 56 Cam 2 Torq Fld T04-50wt 55 $550 $12.9000|$392.22 per 16 Gallon Keg
6/1 ANTI FREEZE Peak Green AF Conc 6/1 $60, Cam 2 Green AF Conc 4/1 $24.90 $8.7300|$375 per Drum
10/1 RONEX GREASE N/A $29.8800|No Bid
MOBIL GREASE HP 35# MYS MP GREASE 35 LB $110, CAM 2 MP GREASE HT TUBES $2.95 No Bid
MOBIL GREASE CARTRIDGE Mob Delvac HD Grease HT Tubes $2.95 No Bid
MOBIL 423 Not sure what this is $555 per drum & $52.80 per 5 gallon pail
MOBIL: CASE/DRUM MOBIL UNIVERSAL ATF Mobil MV ATF 6/1 qt $29.70 $799.97 per drum & $49.99 per case
MOBIL HD 30 Mobil Delvac 1630 4/1 g $62, Mobil Delva 30 55g $895 $697.90 per drum $65.03 per pail
THUBAN 90 Cam 2 GL1 90wt 3/1g $33.75, Cam 2 GL1 90wt 55¢ $550 $10.0600|$799.84 per Drum $77.21 per pail
DELVAC 1330 na No Bid
ANTI-FREEZE na $375 per drum
URSO SUPER PLUS Delo 15w40 3/1g $39.90, Delo 15w40 55g $695 $575 per drum $48 per case
HAVOLINE 30W Chevron 30 6/1 $18.50 no bid
TEXACO: CASE/DRUM |HAVOLINE 40W “ no bid
HAVOLINE 10W40 chevron 10w40 12/1 $36 no bid
MULTI GEAR 80-90 Mystik 80w90 55¢ $850 and other pricing, see attached $799.84 per drum & 77.21 per pail
ANTI FREEZE Chevron Delo ELC50/50 6/1g $52 $375 per drum
SHELL: RIMULA PREMIUM 15W40
DIESEL AND GASOLINE ENGINE Shell Rotell 15w40 T4 CK-4 Bulk $11.95 gl
OIL $9.35 PER GALLON
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Price per Bulk Products

RFB #2024-016 FUEL & OIL BID TABULATION

VENDOR

McCraw Qil Company

Offen Petroleum LLC

Safety-Kleen Systems

DONAXTD: TRACTOR DRIVE

TRAIN, HYDRAULIC, AN
BRAKE FLUID

ROTELLAT 30WT: DIESEL AND

GASOLINE ENGINE OIL

D WET

Cam 2 15w40 CK-4 Bulk $6.95 gl

$8.89 PER GALLON

m 2 J20C Premium Univ Tractor Hyd Oil Bulk $6.95 gl and see attached

NO BID

PRODUCT CONTAINERS:

LEASE

YES/PRICING VARIES

PURCHASE

YES/PRICING VARIES

PROVIDE|YES/NO CHARGE

YES/NO CHARGE

NO
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RFB #2024-016 FUEL & OIL BID TABULATION

VENDOR McCraw Oil Company Offen Petroleum LLC Safety-Kleen Systems
COUNTY BARN PCT 2
Price per Gallon 1/7/25 $1.9707 $1.8422
Regular Unleaded Gasoline (At Transportation $0.0449 $0.0000 %
least 87 Octane Rating) State Tax $0.2000 $0.2000 )
Other Taxes $0.0066 $0.0018 ©
Profit $0.0500 $0.2000
Total Price Per Gallon $2.2722 $2.2440
Price per Gallon 1/7/25 $2.3735 $2.1445
Diesel Fuel #2 on Highway ~ Meets or| Transportation $0.0486 $0.0000 %
State Tax $0.2000 $0.2000 ©
exceeds ASTM spec D975 o
Other Taxes $0.0072 $0.0018 ©
Profit $0.0500 $0.2000
Total Price Per Gallon $2.6793 $2.5463
Price per Gallon 1/7/25 $2.3780 $2.1635
Off Road Diesel Fuel Ultra Transportation $0.0486 $0.0000 g
Low Sulfur w/Red Dye State Tax N/A $0.0000 )
Other Taxes $0.0072 $0.0018 ©
Profit $0.0500 $0.2000
Total Price Per Gallon $2.4838 $2.3653
DRUM XD 3-30 Mobil Delvac 30 55g $895/Cam 2 HD30 55¢ $550 $8.5900|No Bid
DRUM 15W40 Mobil Delvac 15w40 55¢ 4725 Cam 2 15w40 55¢ $450 $9.1500|$575.00 per drum & $48.00 per case
EXXON OIL: DRUM DEXRON IlI Cam 2ATFD/M 55 g $475 $7.5600|$545 per drum & $36.96 per case
CASE/DRUM DRUM TORQUE FLUID 56 Cam 2 Torq Fld T04-50wt 55¢ $550 $12.9000|$392.22 per 16 Gallon Keg
6/1 ANDTI FREEZE Peak Green AF Conc 6/1 $60, Cam 2 Green AF Conc 4/1 $24.90 $8.7300($375 per Drum
10/1 RONEX GREASE N/A $29.8800|No Bid
MOBIL GREASE HP 35# MYS MP GREASE 35 LB $110, CAM 2 MP GREASE HT TUBES $2.95 No Bid
MOBIL GREASE CARTRIDGE Mob Delvac HD Grease HT Tubes $2.95 No Bid
MOBIL 423 Not sure what this is $555 per drum & $52.80 per 5 gallon pail
MOBIL: CASE/DRUM MOBIL UNIVERSAL ATF Mobil MV ATF 6/1 qt $29.70 $799.97 per drum & $49.99 per case
MOBIL HD 30 Mobil Delvac 1630 4/1 g $62, Mobil Delva 30 55g $895 $697.90 per drum $65.03 per pail
THUBAN 90 Cam 2 GL1 90wt 3/1g $33.75, Cam 2 GL1 90wt 55¢ $550 $10.0600|$799.84 per Drum $77.21 per pail
DELVAC 1330 na No Bid
ANTI-FREEZE na $375 per drum
URSO SUPER PLUS Delo 15w40 3/1g $39.90, Delo 15w40 55g $695 $575 per drum $48 per case
HAVOLINE 30W Chevron 30 6/1 $18.50 no bid
TEXACO: CASE/DRUM |HAVOLINE 40W “ no bid
HAVOLINE 10W40 chevron 10w40 12/1 $36 no bid
MULTI GEAR 80-90 Mystik 80w90 55¢ $850 and other pricing, see attached $799.84 per drum & 77.21 per pail
ANTI FREEZE Chevron Delo ELC50/50 6/1g $52 $375 per drum

SHELL: RIMULA PREMIUM 15W40
DIESEL AND GASOLINE ENGINE
OIL

Shell Rotell 15w40 T4 CK-4 Bulk $11.95 gl

$10.23 PER GALLON
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Price per Bulk Products

RFB #2024-016 FUEL & OIL BID TABULATION

VENDOR

McCraw Qil Company

Offen Petroleum LLC

Safety-Kleen Systems

DONAXTD: TRACTOR DRIVE

TRAIN, HYDRAULIC, AN
BRAKE FLUID

ROTELLAT 30WT: DIESEL AND

GASOLINE ENGINE OIL

D WET

Cam 2 15w40 CK-4 Bulk $6.95 gl

$9.12 PER GALLON

m 2 J20C Premium Univ Tractor Hyd Oil Bulk $6.95 gl and see attached

NO BID

PRODUCT CONTAINERS:

LEASE

YES/PRICING VARIES

PURCHASE

YES/PRICING VARIES

PROVIDE|YES/NO CHARGE

YES/NO CHARGE

NO
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RFB #2024-016 FUEL & OIL BID TABULATION

VENDOR McCraw Oil Company Offen Petroleum LLC Safety-Kleen Systems
COUNTY BARN PCT 3
Price per Gallon 1/7/25 $1.9707 $1.8422
Regular Unleaded Gasoline (At Transportation $0.0449 $0.0000 g
. |state Tax $0.2000 $0.2000 ©
least 87 Octane Rating) =
Other Taxes $0.0066 $0.0018 o
Profit $0.0500 $0.2000
Total Price Per Gallon $2.2722 $2.2440
Price per Gallon 1/7/25 $2.3735 $2.1445
Diesel Fuel #2 on Highway  Meets or Transportation $0.0486 $0.0000 %
State Tax $0.2000 $0.2000 ©
exceeds ASTM spec D975 =
Other Taxes $0.0072 $0.0018 ©
Profit $0.0500 $0.2000
Total Price Per Gallon $2.6793 $2.5463
Price per Gallon 1/7/25 $2.3780 $2.1635
Off Road Diesel Fuel UltralTransportation $0.0486 $0.0000 g
Low Sulfur w/Red Dye State Tax N/A $0.0000 @
Other Taxes $0.0072 $0.0018 ©
Profit $0.0500 $0.2000
Total Price Per Gallon $2.4838 $2.3653
DRUM XD 3-30 Mobil Delvac 30 55g $895/Cam 2 HD30 55¢ $550 $8.5900(No Bid
DRUM 15W40 Mobil Delvac 15w40 55g 4725 Cam 2 15w40 55g $450 $9.1500($624.13 per drum & $51.68 per case
EXXON OIL: DRUM DEXRON Il Cam 2 ATF D/M 55 g $475 $7.5600|$554.25per drum & $39.96 per case
CASE/DRUM DRUM TORQUE FLUID 56 Cam 2 Torq Fld T04-50wt 55 $550 $12.9000|$392.22 per 16 Gallon Keg
6/1 ANDTI FREEZE Peak Green AF Conc 6/1 $60, Cam 2 Green AF Conc 4/1 $24.90 $8.7300|$400 per Drum
10/1 RONEX GREASE N/A $29.8800|No Bid
MOBIL GREASE HP 35# MYS MP GREASE 35 LB $110, CAM 2 MP GREASE HT TUBES $2.95 No Bid
MOBIL GREASE CARTRIDGE Mob Delvac HD Grease HT Tubes $2.95 No Bid
MOBIL 423 Not sure what this is $563.31 per drum & $52.80 per 5 gallon pail
MOBIL: CASE/DRUM MOBIL UNIVERSAL ATF Mobil MV ATF 6/1 qt $29.70 $846.07 per drum & $52.88 per (fase
MOBIL HD 30 Mobil Delvac 1630 4/1 g $62, Mobil Delva 30 55g $895 $697.90 per drum $65.03 per pail
THUBAN 90 Cam 2 GL1 90wt 3/1g $33.75, Cam 2 GL1 90wt 558 $550 $10.0600|$799.84 per Drum $74.21 per pail
DELVAC 1330 na No Bid
ANTI-FREEZE na $400 per drum
URSO SUPER PLUS Delo 15w40 3/1g $39.90, Delo 15w40 55¢ $695 $624.13 per drum $51.68 per case
HAVOLINE 30W Chevron 30 6/1 $18.50 no bid
TEXACO: CASE/DRUM HAVOLINE 40W na no bid
HAVOLINE 10W40 chevron 10w40 12/1 $36 no bid

MULTI GEAR 80-90

Mystik 80w90 55 $850 and other pricing, see attached

$798.84 per drum & 74.21 per pail
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RFB #2024-016 FUEL & OIL BID TABULATION

VENDOR McCraw Oil Company Offen Petroleum LLC Safety-Kleen Systems

ANTI FREEZE Chevron Delo ELC50/50 6/1g $52 $400 per drum

SHELL: RIMULA PREMIUM 15W40

DIESEL AND GASOLINE ENGINE Shell Rotell 15w40 T4 CK-4 Bulk $11.95 gl

OIL $9.34 PER GALLON
Price per Bulk Products DONAXTD: TRACTOR DRIVE

TRAIN, HYDRAULIC, AND WET Cam 2 15w40 CK-4 Bulk $6.95 gl

BRAKE FLUID $8.89 PER GALLON

ROTELLA T 30WT: DIESEL AND ) ) )

m 2 J20C Premium Univ Tractor Hyd Oil Bulk $6.95 gl and see attached
GASOLINE ENGINE OIL NO BID

PRODUCT CONTAINERS:

LEASE YES/PRICING VARIES
PURCHASE YES/PRICING VARIES
PROVIDE|YES/NO CHARGE YES/NO CHARGE NO
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RFB #2024-016 FUEL & OIL BID TABULATION

VENDOR McCraw Oil Company Offen Petroleum LLC Safety-Kleen Systems
COUNTY BARN PCT 4
Price per Gallon 1/7/25 $1.9707 $1.8422
Regular Unleaded Gasoline (At Transportation $0.0449 $0.0000 g
. |state Tax $0.2000 $0.2000 ©
least 87 Octane Rating) =
Other Taxes $0.0066 $0.0018 o
Profit $0.0500 $0.2000
Total Price Per Gallon $2.2722 $2.2440
Price per Gallon 1/7/25 $2.3735 $2.1445
Diesel Fuel #2 on Highway = Meets or Transportation $0.0486 $0.0000 %
State Tax $0.2000 $0.2000 ©
exceeds ASTM spec D975 =
Other Taxes $0.0072 $0.0018 ©
Profit $0.0500 $0.2000
Total Price Per Gallon $2.6793 $2.5463
Price per Gallon 1/7/25 $2.3780 $2.1635
Off Road Diesel Fuel UltralTransportation $0.0486 $0.0000 g
Low Sulfur w/Red Dye State Tax N/A $0.0000 @
Other Taxes $0.0072 $0.0018 ©
Profit $0.0500 $0.2000
Total Price Per Gallon $2.4838 $2.3653
DRUM XD 3-30 Mobil Delvac 30 55¢ $895/Cam 2 HD30 55¢ $550 $8.5900(No Bid
DRUM 15W40 Mobil Delvac 15w40 55g 4725 Cam 2 15w40 55 $450 $9.1500($624.13 per drum & $51.68 per case
EXXON OIL: DRUM DEXRON Il Cam 2 ATF D/M 55 g $475 $7.5600|$554.25per drum & $39.96 per case
CASE/DRUM DRUM TORQUE FLUID 56 Cam 2 Torq Fld T04-50wt 55 $550 $12.9000|$392.22 per 16 Gallon Keg
6/1 ANDTI FREEZE Peak Green AF Conc 6/1 $60, Cam 2 Green AF Conc 4/1 $24.90 $8.7300|$400 per Drum
10/1 RONEX GREASE N/A $29.8800|No Bid
MOBIL GREASE HP 35# MYS MP GREASE 35 LB $110, CAM 2 MP GREASE HT TUBES $2.95 No Bid
MOBIL GREASE CARTRIDGE Mob Delvac HD Grease HT Tubes $2.95 No Bid
MOBIL 423 Not sure what this is $563.31 per drum & $52.80 per 5 gallon pail
MOBIL: CASE/DRUM MOBIL UNIVERSAL ATF Mobil MV ATF 6/1 qt $29.70 $846.07 per drum & $52.88 per (fase
MOBIL HD 30 Mobil Delvac 1630 4/1 g $62, Mobil Delva 30 55¢ $895 $697.90 per drum $65.03 per pail
THUBAN 90 Cam 2 GL1 90wt 3/1g $33.75, Cam 2 GL1 90wt 558 $550 $10.0600|$799.84 per Drum $74.21 per pail
DELVAC 1330 na No Bid
ANTI-FREEZE na $400 per drum
URSO SUPER PLUS Delo 15w40 3/1g $39.90, Delo 15w40 55g $695 $624.13 per drum $51.68 per case
HAVOLINE 30W Chevron 30 6/1 $18.50 no bid
TEXACO: CASE/DRUM HAVOLINE 40W na no bid
HAVOLINE 10W40 chevron 10w40 12/1 $36 no bid
MULTI GEAR 80-90 Mystik 80w90 55g $850 and other pricing, see attached $798.84 per drum & 74.21 per pail
ANTI FREEZE Chevron Delo ELC50/50 6/1g $52 $400 per drum

SHELL: RIMULA PREMIUM 15W40

DIESEL AND GASOLINE ENGINE
OlL

Shell Rotell 15w40 T4 CK-4 Bulk $11.95 gl

$10.23 PER GALLON
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Price per Bulk Products

RFB #2024-016 FUEL & OIL BID TABULATION

VENDOR

McCraw Qil Company

Offen Petroleum LLC

Safety-Kleen Systems

DONAXTD: TRACTOR DRIVE

TRAIN, HYDRAULIC, AN
BRAKE FLUID

ROTELLAT 30WT: DIESEL AND

GASOLINE ENGINE OIL

D WET

Cam 2 15w40 CK-4 Bulk $6.95 gl

$9.12 PER GALLON

m 2 J20C Premium Univ Tractor Hyd Oil Bulk $6.95 gl and see attached

NO BID

PRODUCT CONTAINERS:

LEASE

YES/PRICING VARIES

PURCHASE

YES/PRICING VARIES

PROVIDE|YES/NO CHARGE

YES/NO CHARGE

NO
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